
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF THE PUNJAB 
N O T I F I C A T I O N 

February 17, 2016 
No.PAP/Legis-2(120)/2016/1376. The Punjab Public Representatives’ Laws 
(Amendment) Bill 2016, having been passed by the Provincial Assembly of the 
Punjab on February 12, 2016, and assented to by the Governor of the Punjab on 
February 16, 2016, is hereby published as an Act of the Provincial Assembly of the 
Punjab. 
 

THE PUNJAB PUBLIC REPRESENTATIVES’ LAWS (AMENDMENT) 
ACT 2016 

 

ACT XI OF 2016 
 

[First published, after having received the assent of the Governor of the Punjab, in 
the Gazette of the Punjab (Extraordinary) dated February 17, 2016.] 

 
An 
Act 

to amend the laws relating to the public representatives of the Province of the Punjab 
It is expedient to amend the laws relating to the public representative offices of the 
Province of the Punjab; 
Be it enacted by the Provincial Assembly of the Punjab as follows: 
 
1. Short title and commencement.– (1) This Act may be cited as the Punjab 
Public Representatives’ Laws (Amendment) Act 2016. 
 (2) It shall come into force with effect from 1st day of July 2015. 
 
2. Amendments in Act XVI of 1974.– In the Punjab Provincial Assembly 
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges of Members) Act, 1974 (XVI of 1974), the 
following amendments shall be made: 

(1) In section 3: 
(a) in subsection (1), for the words “ten thousand”, the words 

“eighteen thousand” shall be substituted; and 
(b) for subsection (4), the following shall be substituted: 
  “(4) The Government shall, by notification, 

increase the salary mentioned in subsection (1) in 
proportion to the increase in the salary of the civil servants 
of the highest grade. 

 Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (4) shall 
include any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to 
the civil servants of highest grade, having the effect of 
increase in the basic pay of the civil servants.”. 

(2) In section 4: 
(a) for the words “six hundred and fifty”, the words “one thousand” 

shall be substituted; and 
(b) for the words “four hundred”, the words “six hundred” shall be 

substituted. 
(3) In section 5, in subsection (1), in clause (c), in the proviso, for the word 

“five”, the word “fifteen” shall be substituted. 
(4) In section 5-A, for the words “seventy five”, the words “one hundred 

and twenty” shall be substituted. 
(5) In section 7-B: 

(a) in subsection (1), for the words “ten thousand”, the words 
“twenty nine thousand” shall be substituted; and 



2 
 

(b) in subsection (2), for the words “three thousand”, the words “six 
thousand” shall be substituted. 

(6) In section 10, for the words “five thousand”, wherever occur, the words 
“ten thousand” shall be substituted. 

(7) In section 10-B, for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand” 
shall be substituted. 

 
3. Amendments in Ordinance LXXI of 2002.– In the Punjab Parliamentary 
Secretaries (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Ordinance, 2002 (LXXI of 2002), the 
following amendments shall be made: 
 (1) in section 2, for clause (f), the following shall be substituted: 

“(f) “Parliamentary Secretary” means a member of the 
Assembly appointed as Parliamentary Secretary by the 
Chief Minister; and”. 

(2) In section 3, in subsection (2), before full stop, the words “or until he is 
member of the Assembly” shall be inserted; 

(3) in section 4, for subsection (2), the following shall be substituted: 
   “(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 

salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 
Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.”. 

(4) In section 5, for the words “five thousand”, the words “ten thousand” 
shall be substituted. 

(5) In section 6, in subsection (2), for the words “fifteen thousand”, the 
words “twenty thousand” shall be substituted. 

(6) In section 7: 
(a) in subsection (3), for the words “fifteen thousand”, the words 

“seventeen thousand” shall be substituted; and  
(b) after subsection (3), the following subsections (4) and (5) 

shall be inserted: 
  “(4) A Parliamentary Secretary shall be entitled to 

receive utilities allowance for gas and electricity charges of 
his residence at the rate of six thousand per month. 

(5) If a Parliamentary Secretary is not provided 
official residence in Lahore, he shall be entitled to receive 
twenty five hundred rupees per diem for the period of 
residence on duty for session of the Assembly or a meeting 
of a Committee.”. 

(7) In section 8-A, in subsection (6), for the word “five”, the word “fifteen” 
shall be substituted; 

(8) in section 10, for the words “seventy five”, the words one hundred and 
twenty” shall be substituted. 

(9) In section 11, for the words “six hundred and fifty”, the words “one 
thousand” shall be substituted. 

(10) In section 15, in subsection (1), for the words “seven thousand”, the 
words “ten thousand” shall be substituted. 

 
4. Amendments in Act XLI of 1975.– In the Punjab Ministers (Salaries, 
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (XLI of 1975), in section 3, for subsection (2), 
the following shall be substituted: 

“(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 
salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 



3 
 

Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.” 

 
5. Amendments in Act XLII of 1975.– In the Punjab Provincial Assembly 
Speaker (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (XLII of 1975), in section 3, 
for subsection (2), the following shall be substituted: 

“(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 
salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 
Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.” 

 
6. Amendments in Act XLIII of 1975.– In the Punjab Provincial Assembly 
Deputy Speaker (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (XLIII of 1975),  in 
section 3, for subsection (2), the following shall be substituted: 

“(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 
salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 
Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.” 

 
7. Amendments in Ordinance LXXVI of 2002.–  In the Punjab Special 
Assistants (Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Ordinance, 2002 (LXXVI of 2002), the 
existing section 4 shall be renumbered as subsection (1) of section 4, and the 
following new subsection (2) shall be inserted: 

“(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 
salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 
Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.” 

 
8. Amendments in Ordinance LXXVII of 2002.– In the Punjab Advisors 
(Salary, Allowances and Privileges) Ordinance, 2002 (LXXVII of 2002), the existing 
section 4 shall be renumbered as subsection (1) of section 4, and the following new 
subsection (2) shall be inserted: 

“(2) The Government shall, by notification, increase the 
salary mentioned in subsection (1) in proportion to the increase in 
the salary of the civil servants of highest grade. 
Explanation.– The word “salary” in subsection (2) shall include 
any ad hoc relief or special allowance provided to the civil servants 
of the highest grade, having the effect of increase in the basic pay 
of the civil servants.” 

 
 

 
 Rai Mumtaz Hussain Babar 
 Secretary 


