PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF THE PUNJAB

Bill No. 41 of 2011
THE PUNJAB WORKMEN’S COMPENSATION (AMENDMENT) BILL 2011
A

B i l l

further to amend the Workmen’s Compensation Act, 1923.

Preamble.– Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Workmen’s Compensation Act, 1923 (VIII of 1923) for purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is enacted as follows:-
1.
Short title and commencement.– (1) This Act may be cited as the Punjab Workmen’s Compensation (Amendment) Act 2011.

(2)
It shall come into force at once.
2.
Amendment in section 1 of Act VIII of 1923.– In the Workmen’s Compensation Act 1923 (VIII of 1923), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in section 1, in sub-section (2), for the word “Pakistan”, the words “the Punjab” shall be substituted.
3.
Amendment in section 2 of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, in section 2, in sub-section (1)–


(i)
after clause (h), the following clause (hh) shall be inserted:

“(hh) “Provincial Government” means Government of the Punjab;” and

(ii)
in clause (ll), for the words, comma, figures and brackets “Industrial Relations Ordinance, 1969 (XXIII of 1969)”, the words, figures and brackets “Punjab Industrial Relations Act 2010 (XIX of 2010)” shall be substituted.
4.
Amendment in section 8 of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, in section 8:

(i)
in sub-section (1), in the proviso, for the words “an aggregate of one hundred rupees, and so much of such aggregate as does not exceed”, the words and figures “ten percent of the amount of” shall be substituted; and

(ii)
in sub-section (2), for the word “ten”, the words “two thousand” shall be substituted; and

(iii)
in sub-section (4), for the words “twenty five”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.
5.
Amendment in section 18-A of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, in section 18-A, for the words “one hundred”, the words “two thousand” shall be substituted.
6.
Amendment in section 30 of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, in section 30, in sub-section (1), in the first proviso, for the words “three hundred”, the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.
7.
Omission of section 35 of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, section 35 shall be omitted.
8.
Amendment in Schedule IV of Act VIII of 1923.– In the said Act, in Schedule IV, for the figure “Rs.2,00,000”, wherever occurs, the figure “Rs.400,000” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS


The subject on which this law has been enacted has devolved on the Provinces by virtue of the Constitution (Eighteenth Amendment) Act 2010. The Ordinance is required to be adapted by the Provincial Assembly of the Punjab in terms of clause 6 of Article 270AA of the Constitution. Some other amendments like enhancement of minimum level of awarded amount to lodge an appeal, death compensation from Rs.2,00,000 to Rs. 4,00,000 and fiscal penalties have also been incorporated in the draft Bill in order to bring the law in accord with the present day situation. Hence this Bill.


MINISTER INCHARGE


MAQSOOD AHMAD MALIK

Secretary

