2

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF THE PUNJAB

Bill No. 1 of 2009
THE FOREST (PUNJAB AMENDMENT) BILL 2009
A

B i l l

to amend the Forest Act, 1927 (Act XVI of 1927)in its application to the Punjab.
Preamble.– Whereas it is expedient to amend the Forest Act, 1927 (XVI of 1927), in its applications to the Punjab in the manner hereinafter appearing;


It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1.
Short title, extent and commencement.– (1) This Act shall be called the Forest (Punjab Amendment) Act 2009.


(2)
It extends to the whole of the Province of the Punjab.


(3)
It shall come into force at once.

2.
Amendment of Section 26 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the Forest Act 1927 (XVI of 1927), hereinafter called as the said Act, in sub-section (1) of section 26, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be bubstituted.
3.
Amendment of Section 26-A of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in para (b) of sub-section (2) of section 26-A, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
4.
Amendment of Section 33 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in sub-section (1) of section 33, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5.
Amendment of Section 33-A of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in para (b) of sub-section (2) of section 33-A, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
6.
Amendment of Section 42 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in sub-section (1) of section 42, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

7.
Amendment of Section 51 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in sub-section (2) of section 51, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

8.
Amendment of Section 62 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in section 62, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

9.
Amendment of Section 63 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in section 63, for the words “with fine”, the words “with fine which extend to fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10.
Amendment of Section 67 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in -section 67, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

11.
Amendment of Section 68 of Act XVI of 1927.–In the said Act, in sub-section (3) of section 68, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

12.
Amendment of Section 71 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, for Section 71, the following shall be substituted:-


“71. The Provincial Government may by notification in the official Gazette, direct that, in lieu of the fines fixed under section 12 of the cattle Trespass Act, 1871, there shall be lieved of each head of cattle impounded under section 70 of this Act such fines as it thinks fit, but not exceeding the following, that is to say:-

“For each elephant
one hundred rupees


for each buffalo or camel
thirty rupees


for each horse, mare, gelding, pony,
twenty rupees


colt, filly, mule, bull, bullock, cow, or heifer.

for each calf, ass, pig, ram, ewe,
ten rupees”


sheep, lamb, goat or kid.

13.
Amendment of Section 77 of Act XVI of 1927.–In the said Act, in section 77, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
14.
Amendment of Section 79 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in sub-Section (2) of section 79, for the words “two hundred rupees”, the words “seven thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Since the enactment of Forest Act, 1927, no amendment has been made so far in it. Due to decrease of the value of the currency, the punishments given in the avove Act have not been altered or enhanced and are the same which were at the time of enactment of the Forest Act in 1927. In the bill only the punishment in respect of fine have been increased.
Hence this Bill.

CH MUHAMMAD ASAD ULLAH , MPA (PP-106)

MEMBER-IN-CHARGE

LAHORE:
MAQSOOD AHMAD MALIK
15 January 2009
Secretary

P.T.O.


