2

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF THE PUNJAB

Bill No. 2 of 2008
THE FOREST (AMENDMENT) BILL 2008
A

B i l l

further to amend the Forest Act, 1927 (Act XVI of 1927).

Preamble.– Whereas it is expedient to amend the Forest Act, 1927 in the manner hereinafter appearing;


It is hereby enacted as follows:-

1.
Short title, extent and commencement.– (1) This Act may be called the Forest (Amendment) Act 2008.


(2)
It extends to the Province of the Punjab.


(3)
It shall come into force at once.

2.
Amendment of Section 18 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the Forest Act 1927 (XVI of 1927), hereinafter referred to as the said Act, in Section 18, in sub-section (4), the following proviso shall be added at the end:-



“Provided that no order in revision under sub-section (4), shall be passed unless an opportunity of being heard is provided to the person to be affected thereby.”

3.
Amendment of Section 33 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in Section 33, in sub-section (1), for the words “six months” the words “three years”, and for the words “five hundred” the words “five hundred thousand” shall be substituted.

4.
Amendment of Section 51 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in Section 51, in sub-section (2), for the words “six months” the words “one year” and for the words “five hundred” the words “five thousand” shall be substituted.

5.
Amendment of Section 71 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in Section 71, for the expression–


“For each elephant
ten rupees


for each buffalo or camel
two rupees


for each horse, mare, gelding, pony,
one rupees


colt, filly, mule, bull, bullock, cow, or heifer


for each calf, ass, pig, ram, ewe,
eight annas”


sheep, lamb, goat or kid.


the following expression shall be substituted:-


“For each elephant
one thousand rupees


for each buffalo or camel
five hundred rupees


for each horse, mare, gelding, pony,
two hundred and fifty rupees


colt, filly, mule, bull, bullock, cow, or heifer.


for each calf, ass, ram, ewe,
one hundred and fifty rupees”


sheep, lamb, goat or kid.

6.
Amendment of Section 79 of Act XVI of 1927.– In the said Act, in Section 79, in sub-section (2), for the words “one month” the words “six month”, and for the words “two hundred”, the words “two thousand”, shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

1.
The Forest Act 1927 was made to consolidate the law relating to forests, the transit of forest produce and the duty leviable on timber and other forest produce. Although a period of 81 years has passed yet the Law has not been properly reviewed and revised.

2.
Apart from its environmental value forests are a big source of income for the Government; but it has been observed that due to constant negligence, inefficiency and lack of proper vigilance, the forests are open to encroachments and serious mismanagement. This state of affairs has resulted in huge loss to the Government due to theft of trees/wood and other related crimes.

3.
The Public Account Committee of the Punjab Assembly in its meeting held in 2004 had observed that the punishment of fine of five hundred rupees is absolutely insufficient to check and prevent the crime of theft of trees/wood from the forest. The Chairman of the said Committee in a press statement had directed the Department to bring forward an amending law raising the fine to atleast five hundred thousand rupees. No such legislation has so far been introduced by the concerned Department. In order to check the crime more effectively, therefore, the instant Bill is being presented.

4.
Again, the punishments provided in Section 71 of the Act ibid regarding trespass of animals are too meagre and nominal which need to be enhanced for proper check. Hence this Bill.


CH ZAHEER-UD-DIN, MPA (PP-55)


CH AAMAR SULTAN CHEEMA, MPA (PP-32)


MR MUHAMMAD MOHSIN KHAN LEGHARI, MPA (PP-245)


MRS SABA SADIQ, MPA (W-348)


MRS AMNA ULFAT, MPA (W-356)


DR SAMIA AMJAD, MPA (W-357)


CH MOONIS ELAHI, MPA (PP-110)


CH ABDULLAH YOUSAF, MPA (PP-109)


MR KHALID JAVED ASGHAR GHURAL, MPA (PP-108)


MIAN TARIQ MEHMOOD, MPA (PP-113)


MEMBERS-IN-CHARGE

LAHORE:
MAQSOOD AHMAD MALIK
24 May 2008
Secretary

P.T.O.


